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FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 

INOVA Federal Appoints Hugh Johnson to Board of Directors 

Elkhart, Indiana — May 17, 2023 — INOVA Federal, a leading financial institution committed to 
empowering its members and strengthening the community for over 80 years, is pleased to 
announce the appointment of Hugh Johnson to its esteemed Board of Directors. 

With a career spanning over 30 years, Mr. Johnson brings a wealth of experience and expertise 
to the credit union. As a professional in the marketing field and business, his appointment 
further enhances INOVA's ability to navigate the evolving financial landscape and provide 
exceptional service to its members. 

As a member of the board, Mr. Johnson will play a vital role in shaping INOVA's strategic 
direction, policy formulation, and overall decision-making process. His insights and guidance 
will contribute significantly to driving growth, fostering member engagement, and ensuring 
long-term financial stability. 

INOVA's commitment to the community is exemplified through its numerous philanthropic 
endeavors, financial literacy programs, and support for local businesses. With the addition of 
Mr. Johnson, the credit union strengthens its resolve to enhance the well-being of its members, 
expand its community outreach, and create positive economic impact in the region. 

"We are delighted to welcome Mr. Johnson to our Board of Directors. His leadership skills, 
knowledge, and commitment to community empowerment align perfectly with our mission,” 
says Dallas Bergl, President, and CEO of INOVA Federal.  “We believe that Hugh's appointment 
will further strengthen our ability to deliver exceptional financial services and make a positive 
impact in the lives of our members." 
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About INOVA Federal 

INOVA Federal Credit Union is a member-owned, financial cooperative headquartered in 
downtown Elkhart, Indiana. Established in 1942, INOVA was originally chartered to serve the 
employees of Miles (Bayer) Laboratories. Today, INOVA serves over 47,000 members and the 
employees of over 500 companies. INOVA has seven branch locations in two states, as well as 
5,600 service center locations and 30,000 free ATMs nationwide.  

 

 


